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In the gold-rush era of the 1850s, the McKinnons settled on an island off the west coast of Canada, where the
first thing they did was to turn this “wilderness” into an English country garden complete with vegetables,
flowers, fruit trees and an elegant gazebo. After six generations, times and circumstances have changed, the
family estate has been subdivided, the flowers have gone wild, the pear-tree has rotted and the heritage house
has been carved up into a duplex, the property now divided in two by an ugly hedge.

The McKinnons now live in one side of the property, while the other has been sold to an immigrant family
recently arrived from Turkey. The heirs apparent to both families, Day McKinnon and Leyla Zeki, fancy
themselves to be sophisticated citizens of the world, tolerating with thinly disguised amusement their
ancestors’ “outdated” formalities and rituals. So alienated are they that they spend much of their time only
half-jokingly speaking of themselves in the third person. Yet Leyla recognizes something fundamental and
mysterious in the vestiges of the old garden: its tumbled and overgrown ruins remind her of the Paradise
Garden of Judeo-Christian/Islamic tradition—its layout in the four cardinal directions, its allusions to the
seasons and the elements, and its walls that surround a place of secret love. For Day, however, despite, or
perhaps because of the fact that he has discovered a long-buried family secret, “The problem with being born
into paradise is: eventually you inherit it. There’s something to be said for the bedlam of hell. Heaven is a lot
of upkeep.” Abandoning their families for their careers, they are reunited years later having discovered that
love is not just something that happens to us, but something that we must build by hand in the wilderness of
our lives.
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From reader reviews:

Curtis Dugan:

The particular book Paradise Garden will bring that you the new experience of reading some sort of book.
The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to see, this book very suited to
you. The book Paradise Garden is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book through
the official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Viola Boucher:

The reason? Because this Paradise Garden is an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for
you to snap the item but latter it will distress you with the secret this inside. Reading this book adjacent to it
was fantastic author who write the book in such remarkable way makes the content within easier to
understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you because of not
hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot of positive
aspects than the other book possess such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking way. So ,
still want to hold off having that book? If I were you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Jeremy Bryant:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, think reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Paradise Garden which is keeping
the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's view.

Ester Beckles:

As we know that book is important thing to add our information for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we wish. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year has been
exactly added. This reserve Paradise Garden was filled with regards to science. Spend your time to add your
knowledge about your research competence. Some people has several feel when they reading a new book. If
you know how big benefit of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like at this
point, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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