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Seminar paper from the year 2010 in the subject Psychology - Clinic and Health Psychology, Abnormal
Psychology, Atlantic International University, language: English, abstract: It is generally accepted that eating
disorders are a serious concern among women but we are faced with a severe lack of research into the
prevalence of men struggling with their body image. Sadly, many doctors still do not recognize cases of
eating disorders in men with the result that fewer than 5% of all referrals to specialist eating disorder clinics
are male (Morgan: 2008). Pollack (1999) discovered that at Harvard Medical School, there is increasing
evidence that many men (and probably boys too) are becoming increasingly obsessed with their bodies. Men
are beginning to diet in unprecedented numbers with an estimated one million of them suffering from eating
disorders (Luciano: 2002). This figure of one million is perceived to be understated as males with eating
disorders are for too often under diagnosed. Andersen et al. (2000) confirms that eating disorders in males
has been overlooked and in some treatment centres, the ratio of men to women has changed over the past ten
years from almost entirely women to 50:50. In Psychology Today magazine in 1997, an amazing 43%,
nearly half of the men in the survey reported that they were dissatisfied with their overall appearance. Of
those men surveyed, 63% were dissatisfied with their abdomen, 52% with their weight, 55% with their
muscle tone and 38% with their chest (Pope et al: 2000). There does not seem to be a specific age at which
men develop eating disorders, with sufferers as young as eight years old and eating disorders usually
appearing around 14-25 years of age (B-eat). Children as young as two years old have already developed
damaging eating habits, this can lead to eating disorders as the child ages, with 52,17% of eating disorders
persisting into adulthood (Sancho et al: 2007). Morgan (2008) explains that eating disorders and body
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From reader reviews:

Margaret Williams:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information today can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider while those information which is from the former life are difficult to be find than now could be
taking seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you get
the unstable resource then you understand it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for
you. All those possibilities will not happen in you if you take Eating Disorders in Males as your daily
resource information.

Dora Vazquez:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book particularly book
entitled Eating Disorders in Males the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every
aspect that maybe mysterious for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a
publication then become one web form conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get ahead of.
The Eating Disorders in Males giving you a different experience more than blown away your mind but also
giving you useful information for your better life in this particular era. So now let us teach you the relaxing
pattern is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning an
activity. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Fanny Rutledge:

The book untitled Eating Disorders in Males contain a lot of information on it. The writer explains the girl
idea with easy way. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do certainly not worry,
you can easy to read this. The book was written by famous author. The author will bring you in the new age
of literary works. You can read this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or model, so you
can read the book within anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can
available their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice study.

Jennifer Bedard:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information originating from a book. Book is written or printed or outlined from each source in which filled
update of news. On this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual.
From media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel
and comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your
book? Or just searching for the Eating Disorders in Males when you desired it?
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