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The celebration of New Orleans continues and the heat is turned up when Claire Boudreaux returns home
from college and finds herself torn between her father’s best friend, Baxter, with whom she has a mutual
love for New Orleans heritage and has known all of her life, and a co-worker, Jared, an accomplished
investigative reporter who mentors her as she embarks on a career as a television news reporter. She loves
them both, and struggles to make her own decision despite external influences. Will Claire and Baxter’s age
difference and disapproving family members cause her to choose Jared? When Baxter, Captain of the Krewe
of Sancus, becomes embroiled in a scandal involving corrupt city officials, will Claire wash her hands
forever of him and his Carnival activities and political machinations, or will he become the captain of her
heart? Come back to The Big Easy where the good times continue to roll.
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From reader reviews:

Anthony Laflamme:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this The Captain of Her Heart guide
written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book which might be understand by anyone who
else read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and creating skill
only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still hesitation The Captain of Her Heart as good book
not simply by the cover but also through the content. This is one guide that can break don't evaluate book by
its cover, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense
already told you so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Doris Stanford:

This The Captain of Her Heart is great reserve for you because the content and that is full of information for
you who also always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it
information accurately using great arrange word or we can claim no rambling sentences in it. So if you are
read it hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward
sentences but tricky core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having The Captain of Her Heart in
your hand like finding the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no e-
book that offer you world inside ten or fifteen moment right but this publication already do that. So , this can
be good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt that will?

David Earnest:

Beside this The Captain of Her Heart in your phone, it can give you a way to get nearer to the new
knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh from the oven so don't
become worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have The
Captain of Her Heart because this book offers to your account readable information. Do you often have book
but you seldom get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this
inside your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island.
Techniques you still want to miss that? Find this book as well as read it from currently!

Vickie Flores:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our information for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every
year has been exactly added. This e-book The Captain of Her Heart was filled in relation to science. Spend
your spare time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has diverse
feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can really feel enjoy to
read a reserve. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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