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This indispensable new guide to Canadian history is comprehensive, authoritative, and--above all--
companionable. It the essential guide to the significant events, issues, institutions, people, and places that
have shaped Canadian life from earliest times to the late twentieth century.

In more than 1,700 entries, the country's leading historians describe and analyze events in political, military,
social, economic, cultural, and intellectual history, drawing on the latest scholarship. Topics such as
gambling, potlatches, abortion, hockey, capital punishment, jackatars, and shipwrecks find a place alongside
more traditional entries like prime ministers and suffragists, exploration and fur trade, railways and
responsible government. Politicians, soldiers, scientists and industrialists, feminists, social activists and
religious leaders, all make an appearance. Vikings and Basque whalers, Jesuits and filles du roi, the Huron
Feast of the Dead, privateers, charivaris, the Acadian grand derangement, the Metis buffalo hunt, rebellions,
the On-to-Ottawa trek, bunkhouse men and bush pilots, the battle at Vimy Ridge, gold rushes, Spanish
influenza, Frontier College, corvettes, trade unions, midwives, Automatistes, the Mad Trapper, La Bolduc,
free trade and the Charter of Rights and Freedoms, all contribute to the fascinating story which is Canada's
history.

Entries are arranged from A-Z and fully cross-referenced, with a complete index to guide readers to related
topics. This new companion provides learned, accessible, and up-to-date studies of the key subjects and
personalities in Canadian history.
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From reader reviews:

Belia Gillespie:

The experience that you get from The Oxford Companion to Canadian History is the more deep you rooting
the information that hide into the words the more you get interested in reading it. It doesn't mean that this
book is hard to understand but The Oxford Companion to Canadian History giving you joy feeling of
reading. The article author conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood simply by anyone
who read it because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This specific book also makes your own
vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book
style are available. We propose you for having this The Oxford Companion to Canadian History instantly.

Jeffery Fulmer:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, quick story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not striving The Oxford Companion to
Canadian History that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading
addiction all over the world can be said as the way for people to know world much better then how they react
towards the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading habit only for the geeky person but for all of
you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all you who want to start examining as your good
habit, you are able to pick The Oxford Companion to Canadian History become your current starter.

Michael Ramsey:

The book untitled The Oxford Companion to Canadian History contain a lot of information on it. The writer
explains your girlfriend idea with easy way. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do
certainly not worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was published by famous author. The author
brings you in the new time of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can read more your
smart phone, or device, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to
purchase the e-book, you can open up their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice examine.

Mark Morrow:

Is it anyone who having spare time after that spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Oxford Companion to Canadian History can be
the answer, oh how comes? A book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your extra time by
reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides have than the others?
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