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DO YOU WORK BEST AT NIGHT? You might be a RACOON!

DO YOU KEEP A LOT OF JUNK THAT YOU DON'T NEED? You might be a MANATEE!

ARE YOU A VERY FLASHY PERSON? You might be a SEA SLUG!

DO YOU HATE WHEN OTHER PEOPLE TOUCH YOUR THINGS? You might be an ARMADILLO!

ARE YOU BAD AT REMEMBERING NAMES AND FACES? You might be a COW!

DO YOU TEND TO GIVE PEOPLE THE BENEFIT OF THE DOUBT? You might be a GIANT
OCTOPUS!

Take the personality tests inside and discover the animal the YOU most resemble!

You've probably said to yourself on occasion that little Jimmy Applebee eats like a bush pig! Or that Mr.
Henderson is as soothing as a golden plover. Or that Gary Johnson is as fierce and cunning as a hyena. As
you work your way through this guide, you'll be able to make all sorts of interesting observations about
yourself, your friends, your enemies, and big-time celebrities. And from these observations, you'll draw
fascinating parallels between human actions and animal behaviors.

So flip open the book and fill out our quick, scientific personality tests to find out what animal YOU are!
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From reader reviews:

Pedro Engle:

Book is usually written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Next to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A book What Animal Are You? David Is a Dolphin,
Molly Is a Moose will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know
about everything. But some of you think in which open or reading the book make you bored. It is far from
make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you looking for best book or suited book with
you?

Latasha Hisle:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or perhaps
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read
a new book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent the whole day
to reading a reserve. The book What Animal Are You? David Is a Dolphin, Molly Is a Moose it is very good
to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. When
you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to
read this book from your smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book possesses high quality.

Kevin Pinkney:

Reading a book to become new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to study a book. When you
read a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds
of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics,
along with soon. The What Animal Are You? David Is a Dolphin, Molly Is a Moose provide you with new
experience in examining a book.

Wayne Robinson:

That guide can make you to feel relax. That book What Animal Are You? David Is a Dolphin, Molly Is a
Moose was colorful and of course has pictures around. As we know that book What Animal Are You? David
Is a Dolphin, Molly Is a Moose has many kinds or type. Start from kids until adolescents. For example
Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there. So , not at all of book
usually are make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book in
your case and try to like reading this.
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