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Throughout history, the image of the non-Jew in Judaism has profoundly influenced the way in which Jews
interact with non-Jews. It has also shaped the understanding that Jews have of their own identity, as it
determines just what distinguishes them from the non-Jews around them. A crucial element in this is the
concept of Noahide law, understood by the ancient rabbis and subsequent Jewish thinkers as incumbent upon
all humankind, unlike the full 613 divine commandments of the Torah, which are incumbent on Jews alone.
The approach adopted in this now classic study is to consider the history of the idea of Noahide law, and to
show how the concept is relevant to practical discussions of the halakhah pertaining to non-Jews and to
relations between Jews and non-Jews. The seven chapters that make up the first part of this study examine
each of the Noahide laws in turn, with a view to showing their halakhic development in the rabbinic sources,
in the codes, and in the responsa literature. The discussion draws primarily on classical texts by traditional
commentators as they attempt to deal with living issues from the rabbinic world as equally vital concerns in
their own time. The second part of the book deals with the theory of Noahide law, concluding with a
consideration of why it is an appropriate starting point for Jewish philosophy today. 'Any reader interested in
understanding how the non-Jew has been perceived throughout Jewish history should certainly turn to The
Image of the Non-Jew in Judaism for an authoritative discussion . . . scholarly . . . provides insight, not only
into the classical Jewish perceptions of non-Jews and their place in the world, but also into Jewish-Christian
and Jewish-Muslim relations and a more sophisticated understanding of Jewish law vis-Ã -vis the Gentile.'
David Tesler, AJL Reviews.
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From reader reviews:

John Carter:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yeah,
you can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a walk,
shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open as well as read a book entitled The Image of the Non-
Jew in Judaism: The Idea of Noahide Law (Second Edition) (Littman Library of Jewish Civilization)? Maybe
it is to be best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's
book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have some other opinion?

Clarice Johnson:

This book untitled The Image of the Non-Jew in Judaism: The Idea of Noahide Law (Second Edition)
(Littman Library of Jewish Civilization) to be one of several books this best seller in this year, here is
because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this specific
book in the book shop or you can order it by using online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you more easily to read this book, because you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no
reason to your account to past this reserve from your list.

Charles Baker:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading
book therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of
new details. When you read a publication you will get new information simply because book is one of a
number of ways to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, looking at a book will make anyone
more imaginative. When you looking at a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to
definitely imagine the story how the figures do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to
some others. When you read this The Image of the Non-Jew in Judaism: The Idea of Noahide Law (Second
Edition) (Littman Library of Jewish Civilization), it is possible to tells your family, friends along with soon
about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a guide.

Deanna Marcantel:

It is possible to spend your free time you just read this book this publication. This The Image of the Non-Jew
in Judaism: The Idea of Noahide Law (Second Edition) (Littman Library of Jewish Civilization) is simple to
deliver you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not get much
space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you quicker to read it.
You can save the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one
buys this book.
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