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Treasure Island is an adventure novel by Scottish author Robert Louis Stevenson, narrating a tale of
"buccaneers and buried gold". It was originally serialized in the children's magazine Young Folks between
1881 and 1882 under the title Treasure Island, or the mutiny of the Hispaniola, with Stevenson adopting the
pseudonym Captain George North. It was first published as a book on 14 November 1883 by Cassell & Co..
Treasure Island is traditionally considered a coming-of-age story, and is noted for its atmosphere, characters,
and action. It is also noted as a wry commentary on the ambiguity of morality—as seen in Long John
Silver—unusual for children's literature. It is one of the most frequently dramatized of all novels. Its
influence is enormous on popular perceptions of pirates, including such elements as treasure maps marked
with an "X", schooners, the Black Spot, tropical islands, and one-legged seamen bearing parrots on their
shoulders
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From reader reviews:

Kenneth Hill:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you may have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try point that really
opposite from that. One particular activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you are ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Treasure Island, you could
enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh
occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.

Amy Nichols:

Is it an individual who having spare time then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or
just lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Treasure Island can be the reply, oh how
comes? The new book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this
completely new era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?

Tom Salgado:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got students? We believe that that issue
was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. So you know
that little person just like reading or as examining become their hobby. You have to know that reading is
very important along with book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except
your own teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update about something by book. Different categories of
books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is niagra Treasure Island.

Kelly Edge:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is created or printed or outlined from each source this filled update of news. With this
modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
seeking the Treasure Island when you required it?
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