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Which Way USA is the perfect way to teach kids geography while they're having fun. Each month, children
get 2 State Sets full of fresh puzzles, interesting facts and engaging maps. They'll learn as they read, write
and solve their way across the United States. From Texas to Florida to New York - and everywhere in
between - kids' confidence will soar as they complete challenges to earn points for their team of cross-
country explorers. Plus, collectible maps and license-plate key tags let them bring their newfound state
knowledge to the classroom and beyond! (This is from the website to order the maps new: When you place
your Which Way USA order, we'll send you a State Adventure Set for just $6.95 plus $2.45 shipping and
handling. You'll also receive the California State Set FREE! We'll continue to send two new State Sets about
every four weeks for just $6.95 per state set, plus $2.45 shipping and handling, conveniently charged to your
credit card. There is no minimum number of State Sets to buy, and you are free to cancel at any time. You
can return any shipment you don't want at our expense and receive a full refund credited to your account.
Your satisfaction is 100% guaranteed.)
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From reader reviews:

Curt Roepke:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
move, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book allowed Which Way USA? Set
of 50 States, Book and Map? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You already know beside you can
spend your time with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you
have different opinion?

Betty Brown:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new details.
When you read a publication you will get new information simply because book is one of numerous ways to
share the information or maybe their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you more imaginative. When
you reading a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring someone to imagine the story how the
figures do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this
Which Way USA? Set of 50 States, Book and Map, you could tells your family, friends and also soon about
yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a guide.

Eunice Nunn:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Which Way USA? Set of
50 States, Book and Map, you are able to enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still desire to miss it?
What kind of hang type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its
identified as reading friends.

Mary Varnum:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside together with friends, fun activity together with
family or just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading
through a book. Ugh, think reading a book can really hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It
all right you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Which Way
USA? Set of 50 States, Book and Map which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book?
Let's see.
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