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Krav Maga is a self-defense combat system, known for being the official self-defense system of Israel and
used in training Israeli armed forces. It was created by a man named Imi Lichtenfield around 40 years ago.
The founding principle of Krav Maga is that it provides a simplistic system for anyone, regardless of
physical prowess, age and experience, to use to defend themselves against a wide range of attacks. Owing to
its effectiveness and efficiency, Krav Maga has been adopted by a number of military organizations around
the world, as well as police forces and security agencies.

This book provides a solid introduction to some of the principles, basics and self-defense techniques of this
lauded fighting system.

The chapters of the book are as follows:

Krav Maga Fundamentals●

Krav Maga Basic Techniques●

Krav Maga Block and Counter Techniques●

Krav Maga Hold Escape and Reversal Techniques●

Krav Maga Techniques for Defending against Weapons●

If self-defense is important to you, and you are looking for advice on what style might be the best for you to
learn, you could do far worse than having this book in your possession. Krav Maga is a rapidly growing
system that is widely regarded as the most effective for self-defense, and it is also extremely accessible to
anyone, regardless of size and physical condition. Get your introduction to some of the most important
lessons that Krav Maga teaches, and enter a world of self-defense that will make you feel a million times
safer as you walk the streets.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Cardona:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading routine give
you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the
book this improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want really
feel happy read one along with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Typically the Krav Maga: The
Best Guide to Over 50 Self-Defense Moves is kind of publication which is giving the reader unpredictable
experience.

Deana Smith:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the title Krav Maga: The
Best Guide to Over 50 Self-Defense Moves suitable to you? Often the book was written by renowned writer
in this era. The book untitled Krav Maga: The Best Guide to Over 50 Self-Defense Movesis the main of
several books in which everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired many men and women in the
world. When you read this guide you will enter the new shape that you ever know ahead of. The author
explained their strategy in the simple way, so all of people can easily to recognise the core of this book. This
book will give you a large amount of information about this world now. To help you see the represented of
the world in this book.

Juan Crowe:

The reason why? Because this Krav Maga: The Best Guide to Over 50 Self-Defense Moves is an unordinary
book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap that but latter it will surprise you with the
secret it inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who else write the book in such
incredible way makes the content inside of easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the
meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it.
This amazing book will give you a lot of benefits than the other book include such as help improving your
talent and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I were being you I
will go to the book store hurriedly.

Jeremy Windham:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you could have it in
e-book approach, more simple and reachable. That Krav Maga: The Best Guide to Over 50 Self-Defense
Moves can give you a lot of friends because by you investigating this one book you have thing that they don't
and make a person more like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you to get success.
This book offer you information that might be your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than various
other make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? We need to have Krav Maga: The Best Guide to Over



50 Self-Defense Moves.
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