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This book looks at an important turning point in the history of the bus industry in Britain. 1967 was the
penultimate year to the end of an era, when private and semi-nationalized company’s operated the bus
networks in this country.

After 1967 the network was never the same again, with the formation of the National Bus Company in 1968.

The NBC was a very bland organization compared to the colorful bus companies that had existed before
nationalization, and many small municipal fleets amalgamated to form Passenger Transport Executives.

This comprehensive volume covers a large number of the bus companies throughout the country in 1967 and
also has a good readable narrative describing Jim Blake’s journeys traveling on these services across Britain.

REVIEWS

This book looks at the important turning point in the history of the bus industry in Britain, the year, 1967.
The book is illustrated throughout with photographs, mostly black and white, but with a nice color section,
and is divided into three distinct sections. Part one provides an overview in which the author sets the scene as
he remembers it. Part two, which makes up the greater part of the book, is a pictorial overview of the
operators and vehicles that he saw in 1967, and part three takes a look at the preservation movement as it was
at the time. The narrative is a very personal view of the bus scene in 1967, the captions are extensive and
informative and the pictures are well composed and sharp. The author acknowledges the NTA website which
he used to verify details of the various trolley buses that appear in the book. All in all this is a well-produced
volume that covers a period that many of us view with a great deal of nostalgia. The trolley bus coverage is
sufficient to interest the student of UK trolley bus operations and the more general UK scene covered in this
book is a bonus that should encourage many enthusiasts to add it to their collection.
Trolleybus Magazine 11.13.15
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Gross:

The event that you get from British Buses 1967 could be the more deep you looking the information that hide
into the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to know
but British Buses 1967 giving you joy feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in certain
way that can be understood through anyone who read it because the author of this book is well-known
enough. That book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then
can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having
this kind of British Buses 1967 instantly.

Judith Lea:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try and and must have the time or they will get great deal
of stress from both way of life and work. So , if we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely
indeed. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity have you got when
the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do you try
this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, often the book you
have read is actually British Buses 1967.

Therese Webb:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book specifically book entitled
British Buses 1967 your thoughts will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each and every
aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging just about every word
written in a e-book then become one application form conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never
get prior to. The British Buses 1967 giving you an additional experience more than blown away your head
but also giving you useful information for your better life on this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing
pattern this is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning
a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Betty Peoples:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. That book British Buses 1967 was vibrant and of course has pictures
around. As we know that book British Buses 1967 has many kinds or category. Start from kids until
youngsters. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and think you are the character on there.
Therefore not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and unwind.
Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading which.
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