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This book is a warning from the Lord about what is coming in the future. First I wish to share my testimony
of how I came to know the Lord. As a teenager, I became involved in a gang. I drank quite a bit and I went to
a lot of wild parties. I smoked and used pot. I really didn't have such a bad childhood, however, as my
parents gave me everything materialistic that I wanted. If I wanted a car, I always got it. But the one thing I
really wanted was love. I could not find it at home, so I went out looking for it and got in trouble with the
wrong kind of people. Deep inside I was hurting and I thought that I could buy love. When I learned that
what I was seeking could not be bought, I returned home. One night when I was very alone, I heard a voice
say to me, "YOU HAVE COME TO THE END OF YOUR ROPE...TURN TO ME OR ELSE." I felt God
himself was speaking to me, so I asked Jesus into my heart and He gave me real love, true love in my heart.
It was a difficult price to pay, but Jesus paid the price to save me when He died on the cross. Several years
later while I was driving along the freeway one evening, I invited the Lord to fill me with the Holy Spirit.
Suddenly I felt like I was hit with a lightning bolt and almost drove off the road. The Holy Spirit began to
speak to me about the future of this world...about gloom and doom. This is why I recorded my messages
from the Lord and put them into this book, to warn the people about what is coming soon.
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From reader reviews:

Jetta Butler:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the world,
what best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has different
personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't
would like do that. You must know how great and important the book messages from the divine father. All
type of book could you see on many options. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Robert Beck:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book specially book
entitled messages from the divine father your thoughts will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in
every aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a
publication then become one web form conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get before. The
messages from the divine father giving you one more experience more than blown away your brain but also
giving you useful facts for your better life in this particular era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing
pattern here is your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a
sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary spending spare time activity?

Martin Kelley:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended for your requirements is messages from the divine father this book consist a lot of the
information in the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented how can the world has
grown up. The language styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made
some research when he makes this book. Here is why this book appropriate all of you.

Donald Goodman:

As a scholar exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library in order
to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's spirit or real
their pastime. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally there
but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and can't see colorful
photos on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on this time,
many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this
messages from the divine father can make you experience more interested to read.
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