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This book covers all uniforms issued and worn by the Marshal of the Soviet Union, Marshals, Generals and
all field rank officers from 1955 to 1991. It features a well researched and illustrated history of each type of
uniform, the period it was approved for and how it was made. However, this book is not just about
describing and showing pictures of Soviet officers’ uniforms. It contains a comprehensive collector’s and
buyer’s guide, designed primarily to help enthusiasts identify what they might wish to purchase. It provides
anecdotes of the author’s purchasing experiences, including the various traps awaiting the inexperienced
uniform collectors. Its contents will help any student of the Soviet military identify uniforms properly, and
hopefully distinguish an original from a reproduction.
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From reader reviews:

Joseph Griego:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be revise about what going on or facts even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era which is always change and make progress. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you personally but the
problems coming to you actually is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Soviet General &
Field Rank Officers Uniforms: 1955 to 1991: Land, Air, Border & Intelligence Services (Battle Cry! Original
Military Uniforms) is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because this book
serves what you want and wish in this era.

Lillie Granado:

Often the book Soviet General & Field Rank Officers Uniforms: 1955 to 1991: Land, Air, Border &
Intelligence Services (Battle Cry! Original Military Uniforms) will bring someone to the new experience of
reading the book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to read,
this book very ideal to you. The book Soviet General & Field Rank Officers Uniforms: 1955 to 1991: Land,
Air, Border & Intelligence Services (Battle Cry! Original Military Uniforms) is much recommended to you
to learn. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Violet Shook:

You may get this Soviet General & Field Rank Officers Uniforms: 1955 to 1991: Land, Air, Border &
Intelligence Services (Battle Cry! Original Military Uniforms) by look at the bookstore or Mall. Only
viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for your knowledge.
Kinds of this book are various. Not only by simply written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book
by e-book. In the modern era like now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your
problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to
arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.

Cathy Lantz:

Publication is one of source of know-how. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students and
also native or citizen will need book to know the change information of year to year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world.
By book Soviet General & Field Rank Officers Uniforms: 1955 to 1991: Land, Air, Border & Intelligence
Services (Battle Cry! Original Military Uniforms) we can consider more advantage. Don't someone to be
creative people? For being creative person must prefer to read a book. Just choose the best book that suitable
with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life with that book Soviet General & Field Rank
Officers Uniforms: 1955 to 1991: Land, Air, Border & Intelligence Services (Battle Cry! Original Military
Uniforms). You can more attractive than now.
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