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For one charismatic kid, the dangerous world of the Forest of the Dead becomes the setting for the ultimate
escape trick in this exciting debut novel.
 
Jack Carr has been shuttled from foster home to group home to foster home his entire life. The only constant
has been his interest in magic, especially handcuff escapes like those mastered by his hero, Harry Houdini.
When he’s placed with the Professor, however, he feels like he’s finally found a home—but his new
guardian is hiding a dangerous secret.
 
Years ago the Professor bartered his soul to the undead magician Mussini, and when the payment is due, he
sends Jack in his place. Jack must travel with Mussini to the Forest of the Dead, a place in between the real
world and the afterlife, where he’s forced to perform in Mussini’s traveling magic show. If he stays in the
Forest long enough, he’ll die himself. To find his way home, he’ll have the help of Mussini’s other
“minions”—kids stolen just like Jack—and his wits, nothing more. Can he follow the example of his hero,
Houdini, and escape the inescapable?
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From reader reviews:

Agnes Higa:

What do you concerning book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what you problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy individual? If you
don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you
have spare time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. They have to answer that question
due to the fact just their can do that will. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
right. Because start from on kindergarten until university need that The Carnival of Lost Souls: A Handcuff
Kid Novel to read.

Gail Brasfield:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not involve people to be aware of each information they get. How individuals
to be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Examining
a book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information mainly this The Carnival of Lost Souls:
A Handcuff Kid Novel book because this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the knowledge
in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Bessie Barrett:

Is it you actually who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Carnival of Lost Souls: A
Handcuff Kid Novel can be the respond to, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are so out of date,
spending your spare time by reading in this fresh era is common not a nerd activity. So what these books
have than the others?

Debbie Gray:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got scholars? We believe that that question was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And you also
know that little person just like reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to understand that
reading is very important and book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to add you knowledge,
except your teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update with regards to something by book. Amount
types of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is this The Carnival of Lost Souls: A
Handcuff Kid Novel.
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